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Drawbaugh, Bob

From: Jeannie Johnson [jejohnso@dps.state.vi.us]
Sent:  Wednesday, August 05, 2009 1:47 PM

To: Celotti, Stella

Cc: Steve Reckers; Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: RE: REPLACEMENT DATAMASTERS

You've got a grant on the way via pink mail for the Datamasters to be purchased in this Federal fiscal year; we
will send you another grant for the next Federal fiscal year.

This year’s grant amount is up to $125,000 for the period ending 9/30/09; 1 have up to $325,000 set aside for
next Federal Fiscal year to finish it up. We rounded the figures up from your original estimate for unanticipated
complications, but we don’t expect you will actually use every dollar!

The way the grants work is that you make the purchase according to State poficies and procedures, pay the bill,
then send us the bill and the appropriate paperwork, and we will reimburse you.

State agencies are historically the slowest in submitting the reimbursement paperwork, so we will need you to
ensure that the paperwork for this FFY’s purchases is sent to GHSP by the end of October, because once we
close out the Federal fiscal year, we can no longer pay for activity performed during that fiscal year. It'snota
problem, it just means the paperwork needs to be done at the end of the FFY; state agencies often don’t even
start thinking about that until July is looming, and that will be too late. But, as long as your accounting folks
know the timeline, it shouldn’t be any problem at all. That's why | was asking how many units you could get
delivered and paid for by 9/30 this year.

Jeanne Johnson, Coordinator
Governor's Highway Safety Program
5 Park Row

State Office Complex

Waterbury, VT 05671-3201
802-241-5501 Fax: 802-241-5558

From: Celotti, Stella [mailto:SCelott@vdh.state.vt.us]
Sent: Wednesday, August 05, 2009 10:41 AM

To: Jeannie Johnson

Subject: FW: REPLACEMENT DATAMASTERS

Hi, Jeannie, could you send me an e-mail, outlining how the money for the replacement datamasters will be
coming to VDH? {e.g. by , $120,000 will be provided to VDH via grant; by . $240,000 will be provided
etc.). Qur business manager needs something in writing, thanks,Mary.

From: Drawbaugh, Bob

Sent: Monday, July 27, 2009 3:04 PM

To: 'Jeannie Johnson'

Cc: Celotti, Stella

Subject: RE: REPLACEMENT DATAMASTERS
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Jeanne, | just got the information from NPAS that the date can be met for 15 instruments. DMTs with printers,
simulators, maintenance parts, and training materials for 3 additional counties will be [best estimate ] $104,700.
Thanks for your patience.

Bob

From: Jeannie Johnson [mailto:jejohnso@dps.state.vt.us]
Sent: Wednesday, July 22, 2009 11:47 AM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: RE: REPLACEMENT DATAMASTERS

Got it. Thanks.

From: Drawbaugh, Bob [mailto:BDrawba@vdh.state.vt.us]
Sent: Wednesday, July 22, 2009 11:41 AM

To: Jeannie Johnson

Subject: Re: REPLACEMENT DATAMASTERS

I,m in court right now but will confirm with npas that defivery time window can be met (or not) and let you
know asap. Thanks.

From: Jeannie Johnson

To: Celotti, Stella; Drawbaugh, Bob

Cc: Steve Reckers

Sent: Wed Jul 22 11:35:19 2009

Subject: RE: REPLACEMENT DATAMASTERS

We're ready to issue a project agreement, if you agree you can order, receive and pay for the
Datamasters by September 30, and bill us by October 15. What do you think?

leannie

From: Celotti, Stella [mailto:SCelott@vdh.state.vt.us]
Sent: Friday, June Q5, 2009 11:43 AM

To: Jeannie Johnson; Drawbaugh, Bob

Cc: Steve Reckers

Subject: RE: REPLACEMENT DATAMASTERS

Jeanne, this is what Bob came up with for numbers:

Estimate to spend $123,000 in Fed. FY'09 and $313,000 in Fed. FY "10 for instruments, printers and
training materials. The detail of testing, training and deployment will be provided once
information regarding the specific instrument and printer models is determined.

Hopefully this helps, and we apologize for the delay in responding, Mary.

From: Jeannie Johnson [mailto:jejohnso@dps.state.vi.us]
Sent: Friday, May 22, 2009 1:58 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob; Celotti, Stella

Cc: Steve Reckers

Subject: REPLACEMENT DATAMASTERS
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Where are we in planning to add to the fleet of replacement datamasters? We have funding, just
looking for a plan!!

Jeanne johnson, Coordinator
Governor's Highway Safety Program
5 Park Row

State Office Complex

Waterbury, VT 05671-3201
802-241-5501 Fax: 802-241-5558
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