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Drawbaugh, Bob

From: Jeannie Johnson [jejochnso@dps.state.vt.us]
Sent:  Monday, July 13, 2009 3:43 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

I can budget and grant the entire training and conference amount; but if there were an audit, and a finding that
it wasn’t 100% highway safety benefit, there could be a finding to the DOH to pay back whatever percentage it
was determined was non-highway safety related. You let me know what level of funding you want. {And then it
will have to pass the NHTSA test)

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 3:40 PM
To: Jeannie Johnson
Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

| have requested some funding from the dept. but, as | said, they've denied the trip for the past two

years. Substantial support could be supplemented, I'm pretty confident, at least in terms of covering conference
registration and misc. fees e.g. ground transportation & airport parking. The benefit to the GHSP relates to our
continued training and updated information regarding the technical aspects of what is currently available and what
is anticipated for for breath alcohol testing technology as well as addressing legal issues that arise from breath
and blood alcohol testing., Such information helps us to determine how best to use available prograrm funding
e.g. DataMaster replacement money; support for FSTs; interpretation of alcohol test results re: impairment e.g.
familiarity with current NHTSA projects and supported research. Essentially 75-80% of the conference relates to
highway safety A recent conference agenda included : the defense perspective on chemical testing; ‘what booze
dooz’, a history and current technology of fuel cells for testing; professional certification/accreditation for alcohol
testing; data from a surveillance of drugs found in impaired driver sampies; ‘integrating dwi data for use by the
Justice and Highway Safety Communities’; - these are examples from the first two days of the four day
conference.

From: Jeannie Johnson [mailto:jejohnso@dps.state.vt.us]
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 3:12 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

50, did | get everything? | see your request for the meeting is double what | had already planned on.
Does that mean that there is no matching funding available? If that is the case ~ what are the benefits to
GHSP for someone attending? And how much is non-highway-related subject matter?

From: Drawbaugh, Bob [mailto:BDrawha@vdh.state.vt.us]
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 3:10 PM

To: Jeannie Johnson

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

Thank you much far looking out for us - much appreciated!!

From: Jeannie Johnson [mailto:jejohnso@dps.state.vt.us]
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 2:58 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses
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Yes, that is correct. But he includes police officer training, the national DRE conference,
equipment, sometimes, and callout pay. For the purposes of my budget-building conversation with
you, | only included

DOH-related expenses. | actually have a meeting with John Flannigan Wednesday, where | hope to
flesh out the police portion of the budget. Right now, I'm just worrying about you guys (DOH). |
didn’t realize

you were looking at the bigger picture. Hence, my confusion.

From: Drawbaugh, Bob [mailto:BDrawba@vdh.state.vt.us]
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 2:51 PM

To: Jeannie Johnson

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

The $20,000+ would bave been in the budget that Ted Minal! brings to the VT DRE Program.
Perhaps | have been misunderstanding the source of that money - | thought it came from your
program. | was under the impression that our testing fees were being paid out of that budget.

From: Jeannie Johnson [mailto:jejohnso@dps.state.vt.us}
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 2:27 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

This is what the budget looks like at the current state of development. tdidn’t get up to
$20,000. What am | missing? This does not include the Datamaster replacement plan nor
the DRE test case. jj

DOH Lab DRE Expenses

DRE lab tests 5,000
Development of expanded screening test 4,500
Chemist Borkenstein Course:

Tuition 1200

Room and meals 850

Travel 425

DOH Chemist IACT Annual Meeting Travel 800
12,775

From: Drawbaugh, Bob [mailto:BDrawba@vdh.state.vt.us]
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 1:40 PM

To: Jeannie Johnson

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

Jeanne - The $7000 does not directly cover the test expenses. If you are doing the lab test
budget line in the 2010 DRE program budget | assume that the test costs that we bill to your
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program would come out of that budget.| anticipate that our test fees might be roughly
$6,000 for the next FFY. | don't have the current year's budget handy but my recallection is
that there has been enough there to cover both VDHL and NMS lab testing fees. In fact, |
believe a couple of cycles ago we did get a development grant from that budget line item
to prepare to do some of the duid testing so, except for the travel/training, that budget

[ $20,000 + (7?) Jshould cover all the needs unless expert witness costs for a DRE-duid test
case come out of that budget line, too.

Not that I'm trying to over-indulge, but, | did forget to request some funding for us to attend
the breath& blood alcohol testing and legal aspect conference to be held in Texas next May.
We have not been able to get approval for funding that travelftraining for the past two years
from our department even though | was supposed to give a paper at the 2007 conference. If
we can get funding we will again propose a presentation and would prominently aknowledge
support from the VT Gov's Hwy Safety Program. This Is an international meeting which
inciudes all the principle alcohol program heads, prominent researchers in the field and
provides an opportunity to share our experience with the DMT that is still fairiy unique in the
breath alcohol testing world. That trip would cost approximately $1600. This trip would
involve different staff from the previously mentioned drug course at the Borkenstein Institute.

Again - thanks for your considerations. We are making every effort to make the best use
of our resources to staff and equip our program to provide the support needed to address the
impaired driving issues on Vermont highways.

Bob

From: Jeannie Johnson [mailto:jejohnso@dps.state.vt.us]
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 12:59 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

The items you've submitted below is just short of $7,000. Is this all, or will there be
additional test expenses? If we don’t plan for it, it won't be in the budget if you need
it. (assuming Federal money ever starts flowing for FFY 2010}

From: Drawbaugh, Bob [mailto:BDrawba@vdh.state.vt.us]
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 10:34 AM

To: Jeannie Johnson

Cc; Celotti, Stella

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

Jeanne,

The DRE progam wili clearly need lab testing performed in the coming year. Qur
laboratory is continuing to expand our test capabilities and expects to provide a
substantially increased number of tests not only due to the increasing capabilities but
aiso due to the addition of new DRE officers to the program. Also, a recent agreement
with a local treatment program to allow DRE officers to perform training evaluations
there will include urine specimens sent to our lab. We would also like to request a
small grant for supplies needed for development of the expanded screening tests for
the DRE duid samples The screening is expected to lower the overall cost of testing
due fo a reduction in the need for confirmation tests that may now be performed but
may not be needed and for testing to be performed at private consulting labs.
Addtitional test development costs would be around $4,500 which would be be for
well-plate kits; solid phase extraction plates and solvents - ali for use in a newly
acquired robotic sample preparation station. | would also like fo explore the possibility
of at least partial funding for a chemist to attend training at the Indiana Univ. Center
for Studies of Law in Action/ Borkenstein course on the effects of drugs on human
performance and behaviour to be held in April 2010.. That course will help to prepare
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our staff for providing even more effective expert testimony in duid cases - whether
they are DRE or non-DRE cases. Tuition for the course is $1200 travel,and room
and meals at the University are approximately $850 with travel costs about $425. This
program would certainly be a continuance of our expansion of expert testimony in
support of highway safety issues related to impaired driving. Tthanks in advance for
your consideration of the requests for support beyond the lab testing costs. Please
don't hesitate to contact me if you have any questions generated from the information
provided.

Bob

From: Jeannie Johnson {mailto:jejochnso@dps.state.vt.us]
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2009 3:44 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: DRE Expenses

I'm putting together the budget for next year. Will we be having DRE test
expenses next year that I need to plan for?

Jeanne Johnson, Coordinator
Governor's Highway Safety Program
5 Park Row

State Office Complex

Waterbury, VT 05671-3201
802-241-5501 Fax: 802-241-5558

This email message may contain privileged and/or confidential information. If
you are not the intended recipient(s), you are hereby notified that any
dissemination, distribution, or copying of this email message is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete this email message from your computer.

This email message may contain privileged and/or confidential information. If you
are not the intended recipient(s), you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
distribution, or copying of this email message is strictly prohibited. If you have
received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this
email message from your computer.

This email message may contain privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not
the intended recipient(s), you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or
copying of this email message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in
error, please immediately notify the sender and delete this email message from your
computer.

This email message may contain privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the
intended recipient(s), you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of
this email message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
immediately notify the sender and delete this email message from your computer.

This email message may contain privileged and/or confidential information. If you are not the intended
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Drawbaugh, Bob

From: Jeannie Johnson [jejochnso@dps.state.vt.us)
Sent:  Monday, July 13, 2009 12:59 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

The items you’ve submitted below is just short of $7,000. Is this all, or will there be additional test expenses? |f
we don’t plan for it, it won’t be in the budget if you need it. (assuming Federal money ever starts flowing for FFY
2010)

From: Drawbaugh, Bob [mailto:BDrawba@vdh.state.vt.us]
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 10:34 AM

To: Jeannie Johnson

Cc: Celotti, Stella

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

Jeanne,

The DRE progam will clearly need lab testing performed in the coming year. Our laboratory is continuing to
expand our test capabilities and expects to provide a substantially increased number of tesis not only due to the
increasing capabilities but also due to the addition of new DRE officers to the program. Also, a recent agreement
with a local treatment program to allow DRE officers to perform training evaluations there will include urine
specimens sent to our lab. We wouid also like to request a small grant for supplies needed for development of
the expanded screening tests for the DRE duid samples The screening is expected to lower the overall cost of
testing due to a reduction in the need for confirmation tests that may now be performed but may not be needed
and for testing to be performed at private consulting labs. Addtitionai test development costs would be around
$4,500 which would be be for well-plate kits; solid phase extraction plates and solvents - all for use in a newly
acquired robotic sample preparation station. | would also like to explore the possibility of at least partial funding
for a chemist to attend training at the Indiana Univ. Center for Studies of Law in Action/ Borkenstein course on
the effects of drugs on human performance and behaviour to be held in April 2010.. That course will help to
prepare our staff for providing even more effective expert testimony in duid cases - whether they are DRE or non-
DRE cases. Tuition for the course is $1200 fravel,and room and meals at the University are approximately $850
with travel costs about $425. This program would certainly be a continuance of our expansion of expert testimony
in support of highway safety issues related to impaired driving. Tthanks in advance for your consideration of the
requests for support beyond the lab testing costs. Please don't hesitate to contact me if you have any questions
generated from the information provided.

Bob

From: Jeannie Johnson [mailto:jejohnso@dps.state.vt.us]
Sent: Friday, July 10, 2009 3:44 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: DRE Expenses

I'm putting together the budget for next year. Will we be having DRE test expenses next year that | need
to plan for?

Jeanne Johnson, Coordinator
Governor's Highway Safety Program
5 Park Row

State Office Complex

Waterbury, VT 05671-3201
802-241-5501 Fax: 802-241-5558

11/10/2009
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Drawbaugh, Bob

From: Jeannie Johnson [jejohnso@dps.state.vt.us]
Sent:  Monday, July 13, 2009 2:27 PM

To: Drawbaugh, Bob

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

This is what the budget looks like at the current state of development. | didn’t get up to $20,000. What am |
missing? This does not include the Datamaster replacement plan nor the DRE test case. jj

DOH Lab DRE Expenses

DRE lab tests 5,000
Development of expanded screening test 4,500
Chemist Borkenstein Course:

Tuition 1200

Room and meals 850

Travel 425

DOH Chemist IACT Annual Meeting Travel 800
12,775

From: Drawbaugh, Bob [mailto:BDrawba@vdh.state.vt.us]
Sent: Monday, July 13, 2009 1:40 PM

To: Jeannie Johnson

Subject: RE: DRE Expenses

Jeanne - The $7000 does not directly cover the test expenses. If you are doing the lab test budget line in the
2010 DRE program budget | assume that the test costs that we bill to your program would come out of that
budget.| anticipate that our test fees might be roughly $5,000 for the next FFY. | don't have the current year's
budget handy but my recollection is that there has been enough there to cover both VDHL and NMS lab testing
fees. In fact, | believe a couple of cycles ago we did get a development grant from that budget line item to prepare
to do some of the duid testing so, except for the travelfiraining, that budget [ $20,000 + (?) Ishould cover all the
needs unless expert witness costs for a DRE-duid test case come out of that budget line, too.

Not that I'm frying to over-indulge, but, | did forget to request some funding for us to attend the breath& blood
alcohol testing and legal aspect conference to be held in Texas next May. We have not been abie to get approval
for funding that travelftraining for the past two years from our department even though { was supposed to give a
paper at the 2007 conference. If we can get funding we will again propose a presentation and would prominently
aknowledge support from the VT Gov's Hwy Safety Program. This is an international meeting which includes all
the principte alcohol program heads, prominent researchers in the field and provides an opportunity to share our
experience with the DMT that is still fairly unique in the breath alcohol testing world. That trip would cost
approximately $1600. This trip would involve different staff from the previously mentioned drug course at the
Borkenstein Institute.
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